

WATER TREATMENT PLANT AND WATER SUPPLY IMPROVEMENTS
CITY OF BELOIT, KS
Tuesday, April 29, 2025



	NAME OF BIDDER			Walters-Morgan Construction	Midlands Contracting	Marsau Enterprises Inc.	APAC - Kansas, Inc.	BRB Contractors Inc.	Ditch Diggers Inc.	Nowak Construction Co. Inc.	NPL Construction Co.	Timco Blasting & Coatings, Inc.	McPheerson Backhoe Inc.	Myers Construction, Inc.	Engineer's Opinion of Probable Cost
	ITEM	QTY	UNIT	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE
CONTRACT 1 - BELOIT WATER TREATMENT PLANT															
1	Mobilization	1	LS	\$ 1,500,000.00											\$ 600,000.00
2	Booster Pump Station	1	LS	1,300,000.00											1,000,000.00
3	Water Treatment Plant	1	LS	29,550,000.00											20,500,000.00
	TOTAL PART A			\$ 32,350,000.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
CONTRACT II - WATER SUPPLY IMPROVEMENTS - PVC Alternate															
1	Mobilization	1	LS		\$ 34,000.00				\$ 90,000.00			\$ 300,000.00	\$ 210,628.00	\$ 175,000.00	\$ 150,000.00
2	14" DR 25 C900 PVC Waterline	61,400	LF		34.40				40.00			57.75	63.69	86.15	70.00
3	Specified Bore - Sta 420+00	1	LS		128,000.00				107,000.00			211,225.00	187,744.00	135,085.68	80,000.00
4	Install in Road ROW	810	LF		46.00				24.00			111.50	37.30	244.83	100.00
5	Connect to Existing	2	EA		7,700.00				14,275.00			10,147.00	8,350.00	26,640.83	25,000.00
6	14" MJ 90 deg Bend	6	EA		2,500.00				2,700.00			4,081.00	1,741.00	4,677.36	1,200.00
7	14" MJ 45 deg Bend	18	EA		2,275.00				2,500.00			3,781.00	1,483.00	3,975.00	1,000.00
8	14" MJ 22.5 deg Bend	4	EA		2,275.00				2,500.00			3,781.00	1,500.00	4,005.81	900.00
9	14" MJ Gate Valve	5	EA		14,000.00				15,000.00			13,906.00	14,020.00	27,574.18	15,000.00
10	14" Fig. X. MJ Gate Valve	1	EA		14,100.00				15,000.00			13,557.50	13,850.00	27,202.38	15,000.00
11	8" Fig. X MJ Gate Valve	1	EA		2,550.00				2,700.00			4,624.00	2,061.00	4,048.75	3,800.00
12	Waterline Marker Post	21	EA		175.00				175.00			962.00	150.00	150.00	150.00
13	Tracer Wire Test Station	14	EA		370.00				250.00			2,571.75	57.00	254.15	200.00
14	Road Crossing	14	EA		4,900.00				14,000.00			13,030.00	21,214.00	55,766.29	10,000.00
15	Stream Crossing	4	EA		37,000.00				78,000.00			41,510.00	146,112.00	119,411.23	40,000.00
16	River Crossing	1	EA		56,200.00				108,000.00			51,510.00	180,552.00	135,764.08	75,000.00
17	Trench Seeding	5,600	LF		1.50				1.18			2.75	1.83	2.00	1.50
18	Lagoon Structures and Piping	1	LS		112,000.00				150,000.00			50,000.00	84,278.00	139,744.88	65,000.00
19	Riprap	1,850	TN		75.00				105.00			86.00	76.00	129.69	140.00
20	Lagoon Seeding	1	LS		3,700.00				2,000.00			5,000.00	3,000.00	20,000.00	3,250.00
21	Erosion Control	1	LS		7,200.00				2,500.00			7,500.00	7,300.00	17,500.00	20,000.00
	TOTAL CONTRACT II BID PRICE - PVC ALTERNATE			NO BID	\$ 3,030,225.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 3,843,423.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 5,056,240.00	\$ 5,793,558.00	\$ 7,965,265.61	\$ 5,518,200.00
CONTRACT II - WATER SUPPLY IMPROVEMENTS - HDPE Alternate															
1	Mobilization	1	LS			\$ 152,500.00	\$ 480,000.00	\$ 359,000.00		\$ 62,260.00	\$ 134,000.00	\$ 300,000.00		\$ 175,000.00	\$ 150,000.00
2	16" DR 17 HDPE Waterline	61,400	LF			35.63	34.85	36.85		48.60	54.65	55.00		88.16	70.00
3	Specified Bore - Sta 420+00	1	LS			80,000.00	83,600.00	133,800.00		100,420.00	121,600.00	211,225.00		134,112.16	80,000.00
4	Install in Road ROW	810	LF			24.69	28.00	5.00		26.30	142.50	111.50		45.00	100.00
5	Connect to Existing	2	EA			19,200.00	18,000.00	10,600.00		12,605.00	32,100.00	10,560.00		27,848.90	25,000.00
6	16" 90 deg Bend	6	EA			1,256.00	1,070.00	1,075.00		1,105.00	1,175.00	3,500.00		4,345.36	1,200.00
7	16" MJ 45 deg Bend	-	EA			-	-	-		-	-	-		-	-
8	16" MJ 22.5 deg Bend	-	EA			-	-	-		-	-	-		-	-
9	16" MJ Gate Valve	6	EA			16,100.00	18,900.00	17,175.00		15,800.00	23,200.00	17,344.75		27,317.03	15,000.00
10	16" Fig. X. MJ Gate Valve	-	EA			-	-	-		-	-	-		-	-
11	8" Gate Valve	1	EA			3,566.00	3,000.00	3,700.00		3,213.00	6,645.00	5,019.00		4,047.10	3,800.00
12	Waterline Marker Post	21	EA			200.00	50.00	165.00		277.50	178.00	962.00		75.00	150.00
13	Tracer Wire Test Station	14	EA			200.00	50.00	225.00		251.00	230.00	2,571.75		254.15	200.00
14	Road Crossing	14	EA			7,600.00	5,200.00	8,050.00		10,040.00	17,525.00	13,030.00		52,506.93	11,000.00
15	Stream Crossing	4	EA			21,000.00	21,900.00	34,600.00		38,160.00	17,525.00	41,510.00		118,796.85	42,000.00
16	River Crossing	1	EA			80,000.00	59,600.00	66,550.00		100,420.00	78,100.00	51,510.00		135,522.98	75,000.00
17	Trench Seeding	5,600	LF			1.29	1.65	5.00		5.65	4.20	2.75		2.00	1.50
18	Lagoon Structures and Piping	1	LS			35,000.00	110,300.00	109,625.00		155,350.00	262,400.00	50,000.00		139,744.88	65,000.00
19	Riprap	1,850	TN			91.60	122.00	130.00		160.50	70.00	86.00		129.69	140.00
20	Lagoon Seeding	1	LS			8,700.00	5,000.00	21,850.00		19,080.00	21,800.00	5,000.00		20,000.00	3,250.00
21	Erosion Control	1	LS			31,502.00	13,000.00	35,900.00		15,065.00	16,000.00	7,500.00		17,500.00	19,600.00
	TOTAL CONTRACT II BID PRICE - HDPE ALTERNATE			NO BID	NO BID	\$ 3,115,568.90	\$ 3,469,880.00	\$ 3,653,980.00	NO BID	\$ 4,218,897.50	\$ 4,797,358.00	\$ 4,822,924.00	NO BID	\$ 7,787,617.28	\$ 5,518,200.00