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21033-2 - DISTRICT ROOFING PROJECTS - PHASE 2 architects, p.a.
Grandview C-4 School District
Grandview, Missouri 64030 BID DATE: NOVEMBER 29, 2022
BID TABULATION
GRANDVIEW HIGH SCHOOL HIGH GROVE EARLY CHILD. CNTR. CAIR / CONN-WEST
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°° ©° °° BLISTER REPAIR REPLACE WET ROOF CORRODED DECK #1
WASHINGTOM ROOFING & INSULATION X | x| x| x NO BID - - |3 3495000 25 | X |$ 10779500 | 25 | X |$ 75.00 | $ 20.00 | $ 25.00 | X
THE QUALITY ROOFING COMPANY X X X X 1s 1,792,000.00 70 X NO BID = = NO BID = = - S 10.00 | $ 24.75 X
FLYNN MIDWEST X X X X NO BID = = S 42,670.00 21 X $ 162,720.00 21 X |$ 100.00 | $ 20.50 | $ 23.50 X
DELTA INNOVATIVE SERVICES* X X X X S 916,000.00 59 X S 44,000.00 59 X S 211,000.00 59 S 1198 | 19.56 | $ 18.25 X
KAW ROOFING & SHEET METAL X - X X NO BID = = $ 59,800.00 15 X NO BID = = $ 200.00 | $ 12.00 | $ 35.00 X
* DELTA INNOVATIVE SERVICES' BID FOR GRANDVIEW HIGH SCHOOL IS FOR A VOLUNTARY ALTERNATE BASED ON PRODUCTS BY GAF & VERSICO.
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