
Bid Tab
Center for Human Services Ewing Center Renovation

January 21, 2021

1806 W. Broadway Blvd.
Sedalia, MO 65301

p. 660.829.9751
f. 660.829.9752

Contractor Addenda / Bid 
Security Base Bid Alternate 1:

Elevator
Alternate 2: 

Additional Parking
Alternate 3: 

Parking Re-Surface
Alternate 4: 

Metal Framing

Alternate 5:
Voluntary 
Alternate

Days

Construction Solutions & Consulting X/X $1,979,619.00 $135,450.00 $21,573.00 $51,777.00 $302,720.00 NO BID 150.00

Excel Constructors X/X $2,038,000.00 $151,000.00 $14,500.00 $98,000.00 $43,000.00 -$7,000.00 196.00

GBH Builders X/X $1,687,000.00 $139,000.00 $23,000.00 $50,000.00 $224,000.00 NO BID 270.00

Professional Contractors & Engineers X/X $2,132,000.00 $176,000.00 $23,000.00 $49,000.00 $75,000.00 NO BID 270.00

Prost Builders X/X $1,845,000.00 $176,000.00 $24,300.00 $51,000.00 NO BID NO BID NOT LISTED

Septagon Construction X/X $2,000,000.00 $173,076.00 $18,247.00 $49,335.00 $135,765.00 NO BID 330.00

Westport Construction X/X $1,870,000.00 $129,900.00 $25,000.00 $52,000.00 $92,000.00 NO BID 280.00

Job Number:   50.413


