
Bids Received: 9/3/2019
Lochner Job No.: 12847

Bids Tabulated By: MJJ
Date: 9/3/2019

Bids Checked By: IJW
Date: 9/3/2019

Item Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total
No. Item Description Quantity Unit Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price

1 450 L.F. 8.00$                   3,600.00$            3.50$                   1,575.00$              4.00$                   1,800.00$                 4.10$                   1,845.00$                
2 195 L.F. 10.00$                 1,950.00$            5.00$                   975.00$                 5.50$                   1,072.50$                 5.80$                   1,131.00$                
3 1 L.S. 38,000.00$          38,000.00$          37,148.00$          37,148.00$            37,000.00$          37,000.00$               40,000.00$          40,000.00$              
4 1 L.S. 4,000.00$            4,000.00$            4,124.00$            4,124.00$              5,000.00$            5,000.00$                 5,000.00$            5,000.00$                
5 234 L.F. 10.00$                 2,340.00$            3.00$                   702.00$                 4.50$                   1,053.00$                 5.00$                   1,170.00$                
6 440 S.F. 8.00$                   3,520.00$            5.77$                   2,538.80$              5.00$                   2,200.00$                 10.30$                 4,532.00$                
7 880 S.F. 5.00$                   4,400.00$            2.96$                   2,604.80$              2.50$                   2,200.00$                 2.75$                   2,420.00$                
8 219 L.F. 110.00$               24,090.00$          150.00$               32,850.00$            125.00$               27,375.00$               80.00$                 17,520.00$              
9 2 EA. 2,500.00$            5,000.00$            1,275.00$            2,550.00$              1,800.00$            3,600.00$                 950.00$               1,900.00$                

10 468 L.F. 20.00$                 9,360.00$            50.00$                 23,400.00$            31.00$                 14,508.00$               41.00$                 19,188.00$              
11 2 EA. 1,000.00$            2,000.00$            2,751.00$            5,502.00$              800.00$               1,600.00$                 875.00$               1,750.00$                
12 1 EA. 900.00$               900.00$               1,570.00$            1,570.00$              1,800.00$            1,800.00$                 2,650.00$            2,650.00$                
13 2 EA. 600.00$               1,200.00$            1,095.00$            2,190.00$              540.00$               1,080.00$                 585.00$               1,170.00$                
14 3.0 AC. 3,000.00$            9,000.00$            1,350.00$            4,050.00$              1,550.00$            4,650.00$                 1,570.00$            4,710.00$                
15 1 L.S. 5,000.00$            5,000.00$            18,045.00$          18,045.00$            7,000.00$            7,000.00$                 13,000.00$          13,000.00$              
16 2.7 AC. 2,000.00$            5,400.00$            1,350.00$            3,645.00$              1,550.00$            4,185.00$                 1,570.00$            4,239.00$                
17 1,983 S.Y. 4.00$                   7,932.00$            2.25$                   4,461.75$              2.50$                   4,957.50$                 2.70$                   5,354.10$                
18 280 S.F. 20.00$                 5,600.00$            20.00$                 5,600.00$              22.75$                 6,370.00$                 24.00$                 6,720.00$                

133,292.00$        153,531.35$          127,451.00$             134,299.10$            

Non-Reflectorized Pavement Marking

Engineer's Estimate

BASE BID

Emery Sapp & Sons, Inc. Branco Enterprises APAC - Central, Inc.
12033 E. Highway 86 4580 Calhoun

Temporary Marking, Lighting, & Barricades

Reflectorized Pavement Marking 

Springfield, MO  65803

TABULATION OF BIDS

CONSTRUCT HANGAR TAXILANES

ADD ALTERNATE 1

CONSTRUCT 4" ASPHALT PAVEMENT

Springfield, MO  65802

ADD ALTERNATE 2

MoDOT PROJECT NO. 18-091B-1

JERRY SUMNERS SR. AURORA MUNICIPAL AIRPORT
AURORA, MISSOURI

Placement of Topsoil (Obtained on Site)

Permanent Transition Mat

HydroMulch (Revised Per Addendum No. 2)

Splash Pad
Connect Underdrain to Proposed Storm Pipe
Seeding (Revised Per Addendum No. 2)

Neosho, MO  64850
5350 East State Highway AA

Saw Cut

 Erosion Control Blanket (Type 2C)(Revised Per Addendum No. 2)

 Erosion Control Barrier (Silt Fence)(Revised Per Addendum No. 2)
Erosion Control Barrier (Straw Wattle)
Mobilization

36" Storm Pipe
36" RCP End Section

Underdrain Cleanout Riser

BASE BID

CONSTRUCT 6" P.C.C. PAVEMENT (REVISED PER ADDENDUM NO. 1)

Base Bid - Subtotal   

ADD ALTERNATE 1

Perforated Underdrain, Complete (4") (Schedule 80)

1 1 L.S. 10,982.00$          10,982.00$          27,377.00$          27,377.00$            
2 3,552 C.Y. 15.00$                 53,280.00$          10.00$                 35,520.00$            
3 355 C.Y. 30.00$                 10,650.00$          18.00$                 6,390.00$              
4 3,154 S.Y. 12.00$                 37,848.00$          13.20$                 41,632.80$            
5 3,154 S.Y. 10.00$                 31,540.00$          7.00$                   22,078.00$            
6 3,154 S.Y. 2.00$                   6,308.00$            3.50$                   11,039.00$            
7 3,030 S.Y. 70.00$                 212,100.00$        55.00$                 166,650.00$          

362,708.00$        310,686.80$          -$                          -$                         

1 1 L.S. 10,602.00$          10,602.00$          24,037.00$          24,037.00$            29,000.00$          29,000.00$               60,000.00$          60,000.00$              
2 3,486 C.Y. 15.00$                 52,290.00$          10.50$                 36,603.00$            11.25$                 39,217.50$               11.60$                 40,437.60$              
3 349 C.Y. 30.00$                 10,470.00$          19.50$                 6,805.50$              18.00$                 6,282.00$                 11.60$                 4,048.40$                
4 3,121 S.Y. 12.00$                 37,452.00$          13.20$                 41,197.20$            15.00$                 46,815.00$               16.50$                 51,496.50$              
5 3,121 S.Y. 12.00$                 37,452.00$          9.00$                   28,089.00$            9.75$                   30,429.75$               13.00$                 40,573.00$              
6 3,121 S.Y. 2.00$                   6,242.00$            3.84$                   11,984.64$            4.50$                   14,044.50$               4.71$                   14,699.91$              
7 710 Ton 130.00$               92,300.00$          105.00$               74,550.00$            121.50$               86,265.00$               125.00$               88,750.00$              
8 900 Gal. 4.00$                   3,600.00$            5.10$                   4,590.00$              5.80$                   5,220.00$                 6.00$                   5,400.00$                
9 210 Gal. 5.00$                   1,050.00$            3.70$                   777.00$                 4.20$                   882.00$                    4.00$                   840.00$                   

251,458.00$        228,633.34$          258,155.75$             306,245.41$            

496,000.00$      464,218.15$        

384,750.00$      382,164.69$        385,606.75$          440,544.51$          
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NO BID
 SUBMITTED

NO BID SUBMITTED NO BID SUBMITTED

NO BID
 SUBMITTED

BASE BID + ADD ALTERNATE 1 - TOTAL   

 Unsuitable Subgrade Removal and Replacement (Revised Per Addendum No. 2)

 Aggregate Base Course (4")  (Revised Per Addendum No. 1 and 3)

Add Alternate 1 - Subtotal   

ADD ALTERNATE 2

 Unclassified Excavation (Revised Per Addendum No. 2)

Contractor Quality Control Program (CQCP)

 Unsuitable Subgrade Removal and Replacement (Revised Per Addendum No. 2)

 Separation Geotextile(Added Per Addendum No. 1)
 P.C.C. Pavement (6")(Revised Per Addendum No. 1)

 Treated Subgrade (6") (Added Per Addendum No. 1)

 Unclassified Excavation (Revised Per Addendum No. 2)

Contractor Quality Control Program (CQCP)

BASE BID + ADD ALTERNATE 2 - TOTAL   

 Treated Subgrade (6") (Added Per Addendum No. 1)
 Aggregate Base Course (5")  (Revised Per Addendum No. 1 and 3)

 Separation Geotextile(Added Per Addendum No. 1)
Asphalt Mixture Surface Course

Emulsified Asphalt Tack Coat
Emulsified Asphalt Prime Coat

Add Alternate 2 - Subtotal   
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